Bid Tabulation
ITB 4-21 "SOIL EROSION AND SHEETING MATERIAL"
Ericka Andrew, Buyer

andrewe@jccal.org
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2

3

4

GREENPOINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC

HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY

SUNSHINE SUPPLIES INC.

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY

D/B/A UNIVERSAL PRO INC.
GRAND TOTAL $ 3,037.54| $ 2,530.90 | $ 2,434.30 | $ 1,417.46
ITEM UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT.
DESCRIPTION
NO. s¢ o QrY | voM PRICE PRICE Qry vom PRICE PRICE Qry vom PRICE PRICE Qry vom PRICE PRICE

ALDOT SILT FENCE KIT (330’ RL) 5” NON{
WOVENWIDE FABRIC, INCLUDES WIRE KIT
14.5 GA. WITH 5’ 1.25 HEAVY DUTY T- 1 KIT 1 FT* 1 KIT 330 KIT
POSTS, CLIPS AND PIG RINGS (FT*)

1 $§ 297.00|$ 297.00 $ 32670 [$  326.70 $ 27390 % 273.90 $ 091 [$ 299.31

1-NW FABRIC 1-14.5 WIRE 34-5'POST 1-ROLL 38552; *ALDOT SILT FENCE KIT WILL HAVE 0.95 |MFG: HANES GED COMPONENT

MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR:

100 CLIPS 200 PIG RINGS (KIT) MFG:
VARIOUS PRODUCT NO. ALDOT KIT

1-ROLL 81498 34-5'+ POST
100 -T-POST&TIES; 1 BOX- RINGS

LB./FT T-POST INSTEAD OF 1.25 LB./FT**

PRODUCT NO.: ALDOT SILT FENCE KIT
YEAR PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED

NON-WOVEN SILT FENCE 5’ X 3307,
TYPE A -ALDOT

1 | ROLL |$ 10345|$ 10345| 1 | ROLL [$ 9290|$ 9290| 1 | ROLL |$ 89.00($ 8.00| 1 | ROLL |$ 108.00 [$ 108.00
2 MFG: SKAP PRODUCT NO.: 6T135 PRODUCT NO: 38552 MFG: MIARAFI PRODUCT NO.: [40NL _|MFG: HANES GEO COMPONENT
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: PRODUCT NO.: 31-05-330 FABRIC YEAR
PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
WOVEN SILT FENCE FABRIC, 48”X 330"
1
3 1 | ROLL |$ 92858 9285| 1 | ROLL [$ 59.95|$ 5995 ROLL [$ 5500[$ 5500 1 | ROLL [$ - |s -
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: MFG: WINFAB PRODUCT NO.: 100SF_|PRODUCT NO.: 79849 MFG: GEOTECH PRODUCT NO. 48330 O BID
WIRE FOR SILT FENCE PER FT, (330 FT
PER RL) 14.5 GA 1 | ROLL [$ 10345|s 10345] 1 | ROLL [s 7990[s 7990| 1 | ROLL |s 9500|s 9500] 1 | ROLL |s 9333 [$ 93.33
4 MFG: DEACERO PRODUCT NO.:939  [PRODUCT NO.: 81538 MFG: DEACERO PRODUCT NO. 6703 MFG: HANES GEO COMPONENT
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: PRODUCT NO.: 31-39-330
YEAR PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
5* T-POST HEAVY DUTY, (1.25 LB)
S 1 | EACH |$  265($ 265| 1 |EACH [s 329|s 320| 1 | EACH |$ 275[$ 275 1 | EACH |$ 287($ 287
MFG: CMC STEEL PRODUCT NO.: 79704 MFG: CMC STEEL MFG: HANES PRODUCT NO.31-00-560
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: PRODUCT NO. RAW SILT FENCE PRODUCT NO.: 0.95TPOST YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
HOG RINGS (PIG RINGS) “C” SHAPED, 12-
1/2 GA GALVANIZED STEEL
1 | BOX [s 450|s 450f 1 | BOX |5 698[s 698| 1 | BOX |$ 300|$  3.00| 1 BOX [$ 667|S 667
6 100 PER BOX; MFG: HILLS MFG: DECKER MFG: WESTERN WIRE MFG: HANES

MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR:

PRODUCT NO.: PIG RINGS

PRODUCT NO.: 85

771

PRODUCT NO. HOGRINGS

PRODUCT NO.: TYPE B SILT FENCE
YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
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1 2 3 4
GREENPOINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY SUNSHINE SUPPLIES INC. SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
D/B/A UNIVERSAL PRO INC.
ITEM UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT.
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY | UOM | price | price | Q™Y | YOM | price | price | QY | YOM | price PRICE QTY | UOM | prick | PRICE
36’ HIGH X 100’ 13 POST TYPE B SILT
FENCE
1 EACH |$ 3500|$ 3500 1 EACH |$ 3890 ([$ 3890 1 EACH |$ 2500[$  25.00 1 EACH |$ 28.00 [$  28.00
7 MFG: WINFAB PRODUCT NO.: 79244 MFG: TRIPLE D MFG: HANES
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: PRODUCT NO.: 13 POST PRODUCT NO. PREFAB SILT FENCE PRODUCT NO.: TYPE B SILT FENCE
YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
WOVEN SEPARATION
FABRIC/REINFORCING FABRIC TYPE .
SKAPSW315 OR EQUAL, 12.5° WIDTH
8 1 ROLL |$ 410.00|$ 41000| 1 ROLL |$ 33990 [$ 33990 | 1 ROLL |$ 450.00 |$ 450.00 ROLL |$ - |s -
MFG: WINFAB PRODUCT NO.: 38566 MFG: MIRAFI
BALR G A% L CDIUL T o il PRODUCT NO.: 315W PRODUCT NO.: 600X NO BID
WOVEN SEPARATION
FABRIC/REINFORCING FABRIC TYPE
SKAPSW315 OR EQUAL, 172 WIDTH
9 1 ROLL |$ 41137|$ 41137 1 ROLL |$ 32990 [$ 32990 | 1 ROLL |$ 450.00 |$ 450.00 1 ROLL |$ - |s -
17.5' X 258' PER ROLL MFG: WINFAB PRODUCT NO.: 38567 MFG: MIRAFI
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: PRODUCT NO.: 315W PRODUCT NO.: 600X NO BID
NON-WOVEN SEPARATION FABRIC
PROPEX 4553 OR EQUAL, 15’ WIDTH
1 ROLL |$ 465.00|$ 46500 1 ROLL |$ 45998 [$ 45998 | 1 ROLL |$ 475.00|$ 475.00 1 ROLL |$ 466.67 |$ 466.67
10 15'X 300' PER ROLL PRODUCT NO.: 38121 MFG: MIRAFI PRODUCT NO. PROPEX 4553
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: MFG: WINFAB PRODUCT NO.: 180N YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
PRODUCT NO.: 800N
4’ X 100’ ROLL ORANGE SAFETY FENCE -
ALDOT 1 ROLL |$ 7025|s 7025| 1 ROLL |$ 1498 |$ 1498 1 ROLL |$ 30.00(|$  30.00 1 ROLL |$ 1467 |$ 14.67
11 MFG: CONWED PRODUCT NO.: 38307 MFG: TENAX PRODUCT NO.: 701 1P
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: PRODUCT NO. X-05650-00Z PRODUCT NO. 48100
EXCELSIOR SEDIMENT WATTLES, 12” X
100 1 EACH |$ - s - 1 EACH |$ 2695|$ 2695| 1 EACH [$§ 2250(S$S  22.50 1 EACH [§ 1867 |$  18.67
12 PRODUCT NO.: 87120 MFG: AMERICAN EXC MFG: HANES
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: NO BID PRODUCT NO.: 042.1012.20
YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
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GREENPOINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC

HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY

SUNSHINE SUPPLIES INC.

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY

D/B/A UNIVERSAL PRO INC.
ITEM UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT.
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY | UOM PRICE PRICE Qry uom PRICE PRICE Qry vom PRICE PRICE Qry uom PRICE PRICE
EXCELSIOR SEDIMENT WATTLES, 20” X
10°
13 1 EACH (3§ - |$ - 1 EACH [$ 3390 ($ 33.90 1 EACH |$§ 2850 ]$ 28.50 1 EACH |§ 2267 [$ 22.67
PRODUCT NO.: 87125 MFG: AMERICAN EXC MFG: HANES
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: NO BID PRODUCT NO.: 042.1020.30
YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
POLY SAND BAGS, 14” X 26” WITH
REQUIRED UV PROTECTION
14 1 EACH [§ 45.00|$  45.00 1 EACH (§ 0.34 | $ 0.34 1 EACH (3§ 0.40 | $ 0.40 1 EACH (3§ 032 |$ 0.32
100 PER ROLL PRODUCT NO.: 85876 MFG: GEOTECH MFG: AN-WILL BAGO CO.
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: MFG: WINFAB PRODUCT NO. 1426 PRODUCT NO.: S-BAG-SML
PRODUCT NO.: SAND BAGS YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
EROSION CONTROL BLANKETS, SINGLE
NET STRAW, (8” X 112.5 FT)
15 1 ROLL |§ 33.00$ 33.00 1 ROLL [§ 2798 [§  27.98 1 ROLL |$§ 30.00 | $ 30.00 1 ROLL |§ 3841 [$ 38.41
8'X 1125 MFG: |PRODUCT NO.: 87324 MFG: WESTERN GREEN MFG: HANES
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: AMERICAN EXCLELSIOR PRODUCT NO.: S§-75 PRODUCT NO.: 074.005P
PRODUCT NO.: 074-0003 YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
EROSION CONTROL BLANKETS,
DOUBLE NET STRAW, (8° X 112.5 FT)
16 1 ROLL |$ 39.00 | $ 39.00 1 ROLL [$§ 3298 |8 32.98 1 ROLL |$§ 36.00 | $ 36.00 1 ROLL |§ 4320 [$§ 43.20
8'X 1125 PRODUCT NO.: 87325 MFG: WESTERN GREEN MFG: HANES

MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR:

MFG: AMERICAN EXCLELSIOR
PRODUCT NO.: 074-0103

PRODUCT NO. S-150

PRODUCT NO.: 074.0105P
YEAR OF PRODUCTON: AS NEEDED

STRAW WATTLES, 12” 1 | EACH [§  2500]$8 2500 1 EACH [§ 1998 [$s 1998 1 EACH [s - s - 1 EACH [s - s -
. 12"X 10 PRODUCT NO.: 87230
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: MFG: EROSIONTECH NO BID NO BID
PRODUCT NO.: WTLB
STRAW WATTLES, 20” 1 | EACH [$ 2750]$ 2750] 1 [ EACH [$ 2190[8 2190 1 [ EACH [§ 2250[$  22.50 1 | EACH [$ - [s -
20" X 10' PRODUCT NO.: 87231 MFG: WESTERN GREEN
18 MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: MFG: WINTERS PRODUCT NO. #20" X 10" NO BID

PRODUCT NO.: 2010
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GREENPOINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC | HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY
D/B/A UNIVERSAL PRO INC. SUNSHINE SUPPLIES INC. SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY
ITEM UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT. UNIT EXT.
DESCRIPTION
NO. 5¢ 0 QY | UOM | ppice | price | QY | YoM | price | price | QY | VM | price | price | Y | VM | pRrice | pricE
EROSION CONTROL BLANKET
(PERMANENT), TYPE 5A
1 | ROLL |§ 354.00[$ 354.00| 1 ROLL |$ 13979 |$ 13979 | 1 ROLL |$ 215008 215.00 1 ROLL |$ 26667 |$ 266.67
19 7.5'X 120' PRODUCT NO.: 87007 MFG: AMERICNA EXC MFG: HANES
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: MFG: EROSIONTECH PRODUCT NO.: RECYCLEX PRODUCT NO.: BLANKET TYPE 5A
PRODUCT NO.: ETPP-10 YEAR OF PRODUCTION: AS NEEDED
ABSORBENT SOCKS 1 | EACH [3 BE - 6 | BOX [$ 29890 29890| 1 | BOX |[$ - |s - 1 [ BOX [§ - [s -
20 6 X 5' SOCS/CASE
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: NG BID MFG: INNOVATIVE TURF SOLUTIONS NO BID NO BID
FLOC LOCS 1 | EACH [$ 47552[8 47552 1 | EACH [$ 139908 13990| 1 | EACH [$ 100.75[$8  100.75 1 | EACH 3 HE -
8 X1 LB BAG TWO ITEMS QUOTED - TWO PRICES MFG: APPLIED POLYMER
21 MEFG: INNOVATIVE TURF SOLUTIONS  ($139.90 PRODUCT NO.: 706B-81182
MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR: PRODUCT NO.: 3706 $134.90 PRODUCT NO: 703D- 81083 NO BID
SOD STAPLES 1 BOX [$  43.00]8 4300 1 [ BOX [$ 3490 s 3490 1 BOX [$  30.00[S  30.00 1 BOX [$ 8.00[S 800
» 1,000 PER BOX MFG: DEACERO MFG: DEACERO MFG: PRO TRACLE MATRIX

MFG. & PRODUCT NO. & YR:

MFG: DEACERO
PRODUCT NO.: 7460

PRODUCT NO.: #6111

PRODUCT NO.: PT-FTSS-6-100

*All Other Items Shall Be at a Percentage Off

23 [Manufacturers Suggested List Price 0% NO BID NO BID NO BID
(li)aet:very guaranteed not later than ___ days after order 7 10 3 57
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is
renewed for 2nd year _0_ %. 0% 0% 0% 0-7%
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is
renewed for 3rd year _0_ %. 0% 0% 0% 0-7%

Service Facility. Distance in miles from the County where
the service facilty is located: 17 miles 50 miles 12 miles 5.4 miles
Service Facility - Exact address of the service facility: 5521 Eastcliff Industrial Blvd 1214 Co. Rd 1809 1409 Republic Road 121 Distribution Drive

Birmingham Al 35210

Joppa, Al 35087

Birmingham AL 35214

Homewood, Al 35209
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REQUIRED FORMS

GREENPOINT AG HOLDINGS, LLC

HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY

SUNSHINE SUPPLIES INC.

SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY

D/B/A UNIVERSAL PRO INC.
Notification of Intent to Respond YES NO NO YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES YES YES
Signature Page YES YES YES YES
Price Sheet YES YES YES YES
PACA Required Forms NO YES YES YES
Addendum No.1 NO YES YES YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

1 GREEN POINT AG HOLDINGS LLC D/B/A UNIVERSAL PRO | 5521 EASTCLIFF INDUSTRIAL BLVD BIRMINGHAM AL 35210 | ATTN: KYLE SHENEANE | PH: 205-838-1400 | FAX: 205-838-1415 | EMAIL: KYLE.SHEHEANE@GREENPOINTAG.COM

HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY INC. | P.O. BOX 39 JOPPA AL 35087 | ATTN: MISTY MARTIN | PH: 256-586-8760 | FAX: 256-586-4342 | EMAIL: HUMPHRIESTURF@OTELCO.NET

2
3 SUNSHINE SUPPLIES| 1409 REPUBLIC ROAD BIRMINGHAM AL 35214] ATTN: GARY NORWOOD|PH: 205-674-5656|FAX: 205-674-7441 | EMAIL: ACCOUNTING@SUNSHINESUPPLIES.COM
4 [SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY]| 1385 EAST 36TH STREET CLEVELAND OH 44114| ATTN: MONIQUE POTTS |PH: 216-706-9250 | FAX: 248-581-1433 | EMAIL: BIDS@SITEONE.COM
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